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What a week:  
 
Below I provide some quick technical thoughts on the equity markets – probable upside targets (Charts 1 and 2) 
and a quick look at current investor sentiment (Chart 3).  This communication relates to how you might hedge 
your long equity exposure.  Additionally, I continue to believe a 40% allocation to diversified tactical strategies 
(L/S, CTA’s, managed accounts, alternative MF’s, etc.) is prudent.  Essentially, quantitative based strategies that 
can trade the markets both long and short.  It is valuable and important for long-term portfolio diversification. 
 
If you are invested in our strategies, this has been an exceptional week for a number of our trading strategies.  
For example, Scotia Growth S&P Plus has gained on the down days and is now up over 24% for the year net of 
fees (through Aug 12).  It is Scotia’s ability to profit in both up and down trends and non-correlation to the 
general markets that adds value to portfolios.  CMG HY avoided a 5% price decline in high yield bond funds 
having moved to cash in early August.  On Friday, high yield bonds moved higher.  A buy signal was generated 
and we will be trading back into high yield bond funds on Monday.  I have been tactically trading high yield 
bond funds for nearly 20 years and have a very high win rate percentage on our trades.  This is a good short-term 
sign supporting a temporary bottom at 1100 on the S&P 500.  However, I believe it will be short-term as there 
remain very large structural issues.  Issues we are clearly seeing played out in super fast speed.  Europe is center 
stage – deleveraging, austerity, and political dysfunction.  It is a mess.  With the three major economies of the 
world (US, Europe, Japan) in a debt crisis, it doesn’t look to me like the backdrop for strong growth.  And 
growth drives jobs and earnings. 
 
I shared the commentary below with a few advisors on Tuesday; prior to the Wednesday sell-off and subsequent 
Thursday rally.  Following is an S&P chart from the March 2009 low.  I believe we found support at 1100  (for 
now) (Chart 1).  This is tied to a 38.2% Fibonacci retracement number.  Ultimately, I believe we will see 1000 
before the year is over.  Europe is not going to go away, nor is the global deleveraging process.  They too will 
attempt to print their way out of the crisis.  These are the seeds for future inflation in a low growth environment.  
Chart 2 shows the expected short-term bounce targets.  Chart 3 is the most recent NDR Sentiment Chart – note 
the extreme pessimism zone (a bullish reading).  The current support tied to the extreme pessimism reading is 
behind my short-term recovery bounce view.  I believe we will see 1200 or possibly a move towards 1250 within 
a few weeks.  However, I believe that the highs for the year are in place at 1370. 
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Chart 1: 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
Chart 2 – Recovery targets:  Below I point to three logical targets.  The first is a 38.2% Fibonacci retracement of 
the recent 250 point sell off.  The second is a 50% retracement and the third is a 61.8% retracement.  There was a 
gap down from the 1200 level on Monday (not properly reflected on the chart but it exists).  From a technical 
perspective, such gaps are typically filled.  Since the gap coincides with the 38.2% retracement, I believe there is 
a high probability the market will see 1200 in the very near future.  I also believe there is an outside chance that 
the markets will test the prior two lows (1249 in March and 1258 in June) in the 1250 area (coincidently a 61.8% 
retracement) – but I’m not going to be that daring with my recent 401k trade.  As for when to reestablish a 
hedge, look to begin buying put protection at the 1200 area.  1250 marks a very significant overhead resistance. 
 

 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 
 



 
 
Chart 3: Investor Sentiment is in the extreme pessimism zone.  That tied to the 1100 support line is behind my 
short-term bullish view. 
 

 
 
I don’t buy into the bullish hype from Wall Streets sell-side analysts.  If you can sit and hold for 30 years, you’ll 
be fine with your long stock exposure.  The question is “if”.  For a balanced portfolio, I believe a better way in 
this secular bear environment is to allocate 30% to long equities (hedge as I’ve suggested), 30% to tactical fixed 
income and 40% to tactical and other alternative investments.  If I’m wrong on my secular bear view, I believe 
you will still be in a position to profit (yet slightly underperform tied to the extra insurance cost to hedge your 
portfolio from time to time).  If I am correct on my secular bear view, then I believe you will be very pleased in 
ten years and well positioned for a new long-term secular bull market.  I’ll forward an updated sentiment chart as 
we move closer to targets above.  I hope you find this information helpful. 
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Important Disclosure Information: 
This message (and any associated files) is intended only for the use of the individual or entity to which it is 
addressed and may contain information that is confidential or subject to copyright. If you are not the intended 
recipient, you are hereby notified that any dissemination, copying or distribution of this message, or files 
associated with this message is strictly prohibited. If you have received this message in error, please notify us 
immediately by replying to the message and deleting it from your computer. 
 
Please remember that past performance may not be indicative of future results. Different types of investments 
involve varying degrees of risk, and there can be no assurance that the future performance of any specific 
investment, investment strategy, or product made reference to directly or indirectly in this document will be 
profitable, equal any corresponding indicated historical performance level(s), or be suitable for your portfolio. 
Due to various factors, including changing market conditions, the content may no longer be reflective of current 
opinions or positions. Moreover, you should not assume that any discussion or information contained herein 
serves as the receipt of, or as a substitute for, personalized investment advice from CMG Capital Management 
(or any of its related entities), or from any other investment professional. To the extent that a reader has any 
questions regarding the applicability of any of the content to his/her individual situation, he/she is encouraged to 
consult with the professional advisor of his/her choosing. 
 
In the event that there has been a change in a client's investment objectives or financial situation, he/she/it is 
encouraged to advise CMG immediately. Different types of investments and/or investment strategies involve 
varying levels of risk, and there can be no assurance that any specific investment or investment strategy 
(including the investment strategies devised or undertaken by CMG) will be profitable for a client's or 
prospective client's portfolio. All performance results have been compiled solely by CMG and have not been 
independently verified. Information pertaining to CMG's advisory operations, services, and fees is set forth in 
CMG's current disclosure statement, a copy of which is available from CMG upon request.  

A copy of CMG's current written disclosure statement discussing our advisory services and fees is available 
upon request or you can access this information on CMG's website ( www.cmgfunds.net/public/adv.asp).  
    


